
Sat-5

Pray for the team as they travel.
Pray for safety and a smooth flight.

Pray they would be a light in the
airports they pass through. Pray for
the team as they settle in and pray

that they would build each other up
for the week ahead. 

PRAYER CALENDAR VERMONT

Sun-6 Tue-8

APRIL 5 - 11

Mon-7

As the team gathers to worship, pray
that they would encourage the faith

of the believers at Mission City
Church. Pray that the gospel would

be clearly proclaimed and that there
would be unity among them. Pray for

the team as they gather with the
students at Mission City Church. Pray
they would be an encouragement to

each other and enjoy fellowship
together.  

Join the team in prayer as they walk
through different parts of Rutland to

pray. Ask that God would use this
time to increase their own faith while

providing opportunjties for gospel
conversations along the way. Pray for
opportunities that the students can

help connect people in the
community with Mission City Church

as they hand out Easter invites.

This morning the team will be
handing out coffee to people in the
nearby community of Bennington.

Pray this would be a fruitful time as
the team helps make connections to

the local church plant. Pray as the
team continues to serve in the

community, that there would be open
doors to freely talk about Easter and
the hope we have in the Risen King. 

Wed-9 Thu-10

Pray for the team as they serve
MCC’s church plant in Middlebury
doing some cleaning and odd jobs.

Pray that even as they do these tasks
they would do so unto the Lord and

in such a loving, selfless way that
separates them from the world

bringing glory to God. Pray again for
opportunities to have gospel

conversations as they spend time in
the community praying and handing

out Easter invites. 

Pray for strength and energy for the
team as they near the end of their

trip. Pray that they would continue to
build one another up and bear the
fruit of Christ. Pray that God would

move their hearts to worship as they
enjoy time together and reflect on

the week. 

Fri-11

Pray for the team as they travel back
to Georgia. Pray that as they return
and share about their experience,
Jesus will be glorified, their faith

would be strengthened and others
would be encouraged to go with the

gospel to their neighbors and the
nations. Pray also for the continued
ministry in Vermont at Mission City

Church and their church plants.


